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EXHIBIT 2

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF MICHIGAN

SOUTHERN DIVISION
IN RE: § CASE NO. 00-CV-00005-DT
§ (Settlement Facility Matters)
DOW CORNING §
CORPORATION, §
§
REORGANIZED DEBTOR § Hon. Denise Page Hood

SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF REGARDING FINANCE COMMITTEE’S
MOTION FOR ENTRY OF AN ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE WITH
RESPECT TO WILLIAM RUTH, ESQ. (DOC. No. 1353)
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Ellen Bearicks

Pg ID 23392

From: Info
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2013 12:50 PM
To: ‘William Ruth'

Subject: RE: Qarathy-Tayidy

You are welcome.

From: Willlam Ruth [mailto:williamwruth@verizon.net]
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2013 11:02 AM
To: Info

Subject: Re: [T

Thanks!

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 11, 2013, at 10:29 AM, Info <info@sfdct.com> wrote:
RE: SID 0986988
Dear Mr. Ruth: Thank you for your response.
The payment would be $10,000.00.

Sincerely,
Settlement Facility — Dow Corning Trust

From: William Ruth [mailto:williamwruth@verizon.net]
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2013 10:20 AM
To: Info

Subject: Re: (EE——)

My apologies. | will re-send it.

What is the payment amount?
Thanks bill

Sent from my iPhaone

On Sep 11, 2013, at 10:18 AM, Info <info@sfdct.com> wrote:
RE: SID 0986988

Dear Mr. Ruth: Thank you for your response.

Our payment department request a current W-9 form from you. We received a W-9
form on July 25, 2013, but the form did not have a tax identification number or social

security number,
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If you have questions or need assistance, please call {toll-free) 866-874-6099 or contact
us by email,

Sincerely,
Settlement Facility — Dow Corning Trust

Info@sfdct.com

From: William Ruth [mailto:williamwruth@verizon.net]
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2013 10:02 AM
To: Info

Subject: Re: (RGN

This was provided a long time ago

Sent from my iPhone
On Sep 11, 2013, at 9:23 AM, Info <info@sfdct.com> wrote:

RE: SID 0986988
Dear Mr, Ruth;

The Settlement Facility has received your letter in regards to claimant
Dorothy Taylor. The claimant did not request for you to be removed
from her claim. The protocol at the Settlement Facility requires that all
Attorneys submit a W-9 with their tax identification numbers. We have
made several attempts to contact you and request a W-9 form from
you. You may complete and return the attached W-9 form and you will
be added back to the claim and payment will be sent. We must have a
completed W-9,

If you have questions or need assistance, please call {toll-free) 866-874-
6099 or contact us by email.

Sincerely,
Settlement Facility — Dow Corning Trust
Info@sfdct.com

<W-9 Form.pdf>




